

Plastic Culvert Pipe Results  
Bid# 19-55-2  
Prices good 1/1/2020 - 12/31/2021

Vendor	Coburns	Kedco
Size	Price Per Foot	Price Per Foot
15"	\$8.00	\$9.77
18"	\$10.73	\$13.69
21"	No Bid	No Bid
24"	\$17.69	\$21.69
30"	\$27.21	\$29.69
36"	\$33.31	\$36.69
42"	\$43.39	\$46.69
48"	\$54.03	\$56.69
54"	No Bid	No Bid
60"	\$92.16	\$96.69